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WT Naud's book is a humorous heart-felt M*A*S*H type account of the unconventional lives of
CODEBREAKERS fighting the Korean War from the back lines in OJI-JAPAN. Using his NEW YORK
STREET SMARTS, Naud managed to serve his country with the help of the SON OF A MAFIA DON,
seventeen EX-KAMIKAZE WAITERS, Tokyo's infamous BLACK MARKET SAM, twenty stunning MISS
TOKYO CONTESTANTS, rigged BINGO GAMES, a bag full of GOLF CLUBS and a breathtaking
JAPANESE GIRL with COBALT-BLUE EYES. Underlying the M*A*S*H type antics that kept him from
getting shipped to the FRONT LINES, is a compassionate story of the devastation the JAPANESE PEOPLE
experienced during WWII and five years later we find a country still pockmarked with physical and
emotional scars. "Though I was more akin to BUGS BUNNY than JAMES BOND, I had somehow managed
to end up in the ASA, the ARMY SECURITY AGENCY, an organization so SECRET it denied it's own
existence. "At OJI, the most SENSITIVE ASA BASE in the FAR-EAST, COMMUNIST SPY-GIRLS were
luring GI'S into TRYSTS to get TOP-SECRET DECODED information about MACARTHUR'S WAR
PLANS. I was CHARGED with STOPPING them. CODEBREAKERS were turning up DEAD... A beautiful
ORIENTAL COMMUNIST RECRUITER wanted to seduce me.... My FIRST SERGEANT wanted to kill
me... The JAPANESE BLACK MARKETEERS wanted me to stop screwing up their business... My best
friend, the SON OF A MAFIA DON, kept trying to SHOOT himself so he wouldn't get SHOT fighting on
the front lines..... All I wanted to do was PLAY GOLF and stay out of the TRENCHES in KOREA... AND
IT'S ALL TRUE!" "Treat yourself to a large dose of Entertainment, Humor and Human Drama. WT Naud's
book is better than M*A*S*H because it all really happened! I've known every character in the book." Peter
Marshall/ MC Hollywood Squares "Oji is the culmination of a writing career in a styleof wit and wisdom
that's well worth reading." Joel D. Swanson/ Writer for Network Series including the Dick Van Dyck Show
and Mayberry Rfd.
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From reader reviews:

Dennis Boone:

The book Oji-Spy Girls at the Gate gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can use to
make your capable much more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting tension or
having big problem using your subject. If you can make examining a book Oji-Spy Girls at the Gate being
your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about
several or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open and read a book Oji-Spy Girls at the
Gate. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do
you think about this guide?

Carl Kile:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently, people have do
something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by means
of surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Sure, by
reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is high. For you
personally who want to start reading a new book, we give you this specific Oji-Spy Girls at the Gate book as
starter and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Philip Cooper:

This book untitled Oji-Spy Girls at the Gate to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, that
is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of
book in the book shop or you can order it by means of online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too.
It makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no
reason for your requirements to past this e-book from your list.

Julia Watkins:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
even playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is look different you can
read a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent
all day every day to reading a publication. The book Oji-Spy Girls at the Gate it is very good to read. There
are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. Should
you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore simply to
read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book offers high quality.
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