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Elizabeth is at a crossroad. She's been given the chance to experience life outside of her community, away
from the responsibility to care for her eight younger siblings, but Elizabeth Bontrager can't decide which
road to take. Goshen has its charms and pressures, but Paradise, Pennsylvania, sounds . . . well, like paradise.
And it's also home to her Englisch friend, Paula. Decision made. Elizabeth is Paradise bound.

But will the small town live up to its name? When Elizabeth meets Paula's friend, Bruce, she quickly learns
he wants more than a friendship. And the same might be true of Saul Miller, her new boss at the country
story that sells Amish products to the Englisch community. As the two compete for her attention, Elizabeth is
surprised to realize she misses her family and becomes even more uncertain about where she belongs. She
has a choice to make: return home or embrace this new life and possibly a new love?
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From reader reviews:

Eloise Torres:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, the actual best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book A Road Unknown: Amish
Roads Series - Book 1. All type of book is it possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet
resources or other social media.

Willie Grajeda:

This A Road Unknown: Amish Roads Series - Book 1 book is not really ordinary book, you have after that it
the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is usually information inside this
reserve incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information
you will get. This kind of A Road Unknown: Amish Roads Series - Book 1 without we realize teach the one
who reading through it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't always be worry A Road
Unknown: Amish Roads Series - Book 1 can bring any time you are and not make your case space or
bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even phone. This A Road
Unknown: Amish Roads Series - Book 1 having excellent arrangement in word and layout, so you will not
sense uninterested in reading.

Gary Lewis:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to examine a book. When you read a book
you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the fact
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that
you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The A Road Unknown: Amish Roads Series - Book 1 provide you with new experience in
studying a book.

Irish Watts:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is
referred to as of book A Road Unknown: Amish Roads Series - Book 1. You can contribute your knowledge
by it. Without departing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make an individual happier to
read. It is most essential that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one destination to other
place.
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