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The powerful thesis of this book is that in order to achieve full selfhood we must all repeatedly and endlessly
kill the phantasmatic image of ourselves instilled in us by our parents. We must all combat what the author
calls “primary narcissism,” a projection of the child our parents wanted. This idea—that each of us carries as
a burden an unconscious secret of our parents, a hidden desire that we are made to live out but that we must
kill in order to “be born”—touches on some of the fundamental issues of psychoanalytic theory. Around it,
the author builds an intricate analysis of the relation between primary narcissism and the death drive.

Each of the book’s five chapters begins with one or more case studies drawn from the author’s clinical
experience as a psychoanalyst. In these studies he links his central concern—the image of the child created
by the unconscious desire of the parents—to other issues, such as the question of love, the concept of the
subject, and the death drive. In the penultimate chapter, on transference, the author challenges the
commonplace understanding of the analyst’s impassivity. What does such impassivity imply, especially in
the context of a “transferential love” between a female patient and a male analyst? In replying to this
question, the author forcefully reassesses the relation of psychoanalysis to femininity, to the question “What
does a woman want?”

Serge Leclaire’s overarching thesis leads to a provocative rereading of the Oedipal configuration. Leclaire
suggests that he is inhabited, pursued, haunted, and debilitated by the child who should have died in order
that Oedipus might have been born into life.
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From reader reviews:

Terry Kline:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book A Child Is Being Killed: On Primary Narcissism and the
Death Drive (Meridian: Crossing Aesthetics). You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a
book. As long as we know about how is important some sort of book A Child Is Being Killed: On Primary
Narcissism and the Death Drive (Meridian: Crossing Aesthetics). You can add expertise and of course you
can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can know everything!
From your country right up until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple point until wonderful
thing you can know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or even searching by internet system. It is
called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Michael Burr:

The book A Child Is Being Killed: On Primary Narcissism and the Death Drive (Meridian: Crossing
Aesthetics) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable more increase.
Book can for being your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem with the subject. If you
can make studying a book A Child Is Being Killed: On Primary Narcissism and the Death Drive (Meridian:
Crossing Aesthetics) to become your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your capable, increase
your knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open up and read a reserve
A Child Is Being Killed: On Primary Narcissism and the Death Drive (Meridian: Crossing Aesthetics). Kinds
of book are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think
about this book?

Mary McClellan:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great and also important the book A Child Is Being Killed: On
Primary Narcissism and the Death Drive (Meridian: Crossing Aesthetics). All type of book can you see on
many solutions. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Gary Roth:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family members
or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read
some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent
the entire day to reading a e-book. The book A Child Is Being Killed: On Primary Narcissism and the Death
Drive (Meridian: Crossing Aesthetics) it is quite good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended



this book. They were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space to deliver this book you
can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from your smart phone. The price is
not very costly but this book offers high quality.
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