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This is a rigorous and complete textbook for a first course on information retrieval from the computer
science perspective. It provides an up-to-date student oriented treatment of information retrieval including
extensive coverage of new topics such as web retrieval, web crawling, open source search engines and user
interfaces.

From parsing to indexing, clustering to classification, retrieval to ranking, and user feedback to retrieval
evaluation, all of the most important concepts are carefully introduced and exemplified. The contents and
structure of the book have been carefully designed by the two main authors, with individual contributions
coming from leading international authorities in the field, including Yoelle Maarek, Senior Director of
Yahoo! Research Israel; Dulce Poncele´on IBM Research; and Malcolm Slaney, Yahoo Research USA.

This completely reorganized, revised and enlarged second edition of Modern Information Retrieval contains
many new chapters and double the number of pages and bibliographic references of the first edition, and a
companion website www.mir2ed.org with teaching material. It will prove invaluable to students, professors,
researchers, practitioners, and scholars of this fascinating field of information retrieval.
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From reader reviews:

Trevor Cianciolo:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite guide and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Modern Information Retrieval: The Concepts and
Technology behind Search (2nd Edition) (ACM Press Books). Try to face the book Modern Information
Retrieval: The Concepts and Technology behind Search (2nd Edition) (ACM Press Books) as your good
friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you experience alone and beside regarding course
make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you more
confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , we need to make new experience along with
knowledge with this book.

Veronica Roberts:

The book Modern Information Retrieval: The Concepts and Technology behind Search (2nd Edition) (ACM
Press Books) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want.
So just why must we leave the good thing like a book Modern Information Retrieval: The Concepts and
Technology behind Search (2nd Edition) (ACM Press Books)? Some of you have a different opinion about
publication. But one aim that book can give many details for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try
to closer along with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you are able to give for
each other; you could share all of these. Book Modern Information Retrieval: The Concepts and Technology
behind Search (2nd Edition) (ACM Press Books) has simple shape but you know: it has great and big
function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is very
wonderful.

Jackie Caldwell:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading practice
give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the information inside
the book this improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want experience happy read
one using theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The particular Modern Information Retrieval: The
Concepts and Technology behind Search (2nd Edition) (ACM Press Books) is kind of publication which is
giving the reader capricious experience.

Michelle Mills:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Modern Information Retrieval: The Concepts
and Technology behind Search (2nd Edition) (ACM Press Books) e-book written by well-known writer we
are excited for well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written



throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your personal
hunger then you still hesitation Modern Information Retrieval: The Concepts and Technology behind Search
(2nd Edition) (ACM Press Books) as good book not simply by the cover but also with the content. This is
one book that can break don't assess book by its protect, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to
pick this!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to
another sixth sense.
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