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This historic book may have numerous typos and missing text. Purchasers can download a free scanned copy
of the original book (without typos) from the publisher. Not indexed. Not illustrated. 1892. Excerpt: ...
Remarks upon a Book entitled 'The Fable of the "Bees." I HAVE read your several Compositions in favour
of the Vices and Corruptions of Mankind; and hope I need make no Apology, for presuming to offer a Word
or two on the Side of Virtue and Religion. I shall spend no Time in Preface, or general Reflections, but
proceed directly to the Examination of such Passages as expose moral Virtue, as a Fraud and imposition, and
render all Pretences to it, as odious and contemptible. Though I direct myself to you, I hope it will be no
Offence, if I sometimes speak, as if I was speaking to a Christian, or show some ways of thinking, that may
be owing to that kind of worship which is professed amongst us. Ways of thinking derived from revealed
Religion are much more suitable to our low Capacities, than any arrogant Pretences to be wise, by our own
Light. Moral Virtue, however disregarded in Practice, has hitherto had a speculative Esteem amongst Men;
her Praises have been celebrated by Authors of all kinds, as the confessed Beauty, Ornament, and Perfection
of Human Nature. On the contrary, Immorality has been looked upon as the greatest Reproach and Torment
of Mankind; no Satire has been thought severe enough upon its natural Baseness and Deformity, nor any Wit
able to express the Evils it occasions in private Life, and public Societies. Your Goodness would not suffer
you to see this part of Christendom, deluded with such false Notions, of I know not what Excellence in
Virtue, or Evil in Vice, but obliged you immediately to compose a System (as you call it) wherein you do
these three things. ist. You consider Man, merely as an Animal, having, like other Animals, nothing to do but
to follow his Appetites. 2dly. You consider Man as cheated and flattered out of his natural...
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From reader reviews:

Brian Wilson:

The ability that you get from The Works of the Reverend William Law, M.a. (Volume 2); Remarks Upon
"The Fable of the Bees". the Case of Reason, or Natural Religion, Fairly and ... of Stage Entertainments
Fully Demonstrated is the more deep you digging the information that hide inside words the more you get
serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but The Works of the Reverend
William Law, M.a. (Volume 2); Remarks Upon "The Fable of the Bees". the Case of Reason, or Natural
Religion, Fairly and ... of Stage Entertainments Fully Demonstrated giving you thrill feeling of reading. The
article writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood simply by anyone who read that
because the author of this book is well-known enough. This book also makes your own personal vocabulary
increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style
are available. We advise you for having this kind of The Works of the Reverend William Law, M.a. (Volume
2); Remarks Upon "The Fable of the Bees". the Case of Reason, or Natural Religion, Fairly and ... of Stage
Entertainments Fully Demonstrated instantly.

Gregory Richards:

This book untitled The Works of the Reverend William Law, M.a. (Volume 2); Remarks Upon "The Fable of
the Bees". the Case of Reason, or Natural Religion, Fairly and ... of Stage Entertainments Fully
Demonstrated to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this
e-book you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book shop or
you can order it via online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this
book, as you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this guide
from your list.

Donald Dickens:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to
beach, or picnic inside park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your own free time/ holiday? May be reading a book is usually option to fill your
cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If
you want to consider look for book, may be the book untitled The Works of the Reverend William Law, M.a.
(Volume 2); Remarks Upon "The Fable of the Bees". the Case of Reason, or Natural Religion, Fairly and ...
of Stage Entertainments Fully Demonstrated can be good book to read. May be it could be best activity to
you.



April Brooks:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its handle may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer might be The Works of the Reverend William Law, M.a. (Volume
2); Remarks Upon "The Fable of the Bees". the Case of Reason, or Natural Religion, Fairly and ... of Stage
Entertainments Fully Demonstrated why because the wonderful cover that make you consider about the
content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or maybe
cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.
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