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This is the proceedings of a workshop held on November 7 and 8, 2005 in Long Beach, California, USA,
hosted by the Software Diagnostics and Conformance Testing Division, Information Technology Laboratory,
of the National Institute of Standards and Technology. The workshop, "Software Security Assurance Tools,
Techniques, and Metrics," is one of a series in the NIST Software Assurance Measurement and Tool
Evaluation (SAMATE) project, which is partially funded by DHS to help identify and enhance software
security assurance (SSA) tools. The goal of this workshop is to discuss and refine the taxonomy of flaws and
the taxonomy of functions, come to a consensus on which SSA functions should first have specifications and
standards tests developed, gather SSA tools suppliers for "target practice" on reference datasets of code, and
identify gaps or research needs in SSA functions.
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From reader reviews:

Caroline Gonzalez:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yep, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to
take a stroll, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled
Proceedings of Workshop on Software Security Assurance Tools, Techniques, and Metrics? Maybe it is to
become best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's
book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have various other opinion?

Michael Lockwood:

This book untitled Proceedings of Workshop on Software Security Assurance Tools, Techniques, and
Metrics to be one of several books this best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this
guide you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this book in the book retailer or you can
order it through online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this
book, as you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to
past this book from your list.

Kathryn Hebert:

The book untitled Proceedings of Workshop on Software Security Assurance Tools, Techniques, and Metrics
contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains the girl idea with easy means. The language is very
clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous
author. The author provides you in the new period of time of literary works. You can read this book because
you can read more your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice
go through.

Rosa Felton:

This Proceedings of Workshop on Software Security Assurance Tools, Techniques, and Metrics is brand new
way for you who has attention to look for some information because it relief your hunger of knowledge.
Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having little bit of digest in
reading this Proceedings of Workshop on Software Security Assurance Tools, Techniques, and Metrics can
be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this particular book is easy to get by
anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book web
form. People who think that in publication form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this e-book is the answer.
So there is no in reading a publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should
be here for an individual. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book style for your better life and also
knowledge.
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