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Distillery Cats tells the whimsical tale of working cats in distilleries around the world, with charming
illustrations and photographs of the beloved mousers.

Distillery Cats cheekily tells the tale of the historical role of distillery cats and their evolution to current
brand ambassadors. James Beard Award-winning author (and noted cat enthusiast) Brad Thomas Parsons
profiles 40 of the world's most adorable and lovable distillery cats, featuring "interviews," a hand-drawn
portrait of each cat, plus trading card-style stat sheets with figures like "years active" and "mice killed."
Featuring cocktail recipes to enjoy while you page through, Distillery Cats is a quirky but essential addition
to any cat or spirits lover's bookshelf.
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From reader reviews:

Morris Whitfield:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a guide you will get new information since book is one of numerous ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to others. When you read this Distillery Cats:
Profiles in Courage of the World's Most Spirited Mousers, you may tells your family, friends as well as soon
about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a book.

Julia Sullivan:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to
beach, or picnic within the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your
totally free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If
you want to try look for book, may be the book untitled Distillery Cats: Profiles in Courage of the World's
Most Spirited Mousers can be good book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

James Gardner:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, brief story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving Distillery Cats: Profiles in Courage
of the World's Most Spirited Mousers that give your fun preference will be satisfied through reading this
book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world much better then
how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading routine only for the geeky
man or woman but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start looking
at as your good habit, it is possible to pick Distillery Cats: Profiles in Courage of the World's Most Spirited
Mousers become your starter.

Eric Baur:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can
have it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This particular Distillery Cats: Profiles in Courage of
the World's Most Spirited Mousers can give you a lot of friends because by you looking at this one book you
have matter that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a
step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't realize, by
knowing more than different make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let me have
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