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Mix drinks like a pro with this indispensible collection of 150 of the world's finest cocktails, all of which can
be made from the comfort of your own mixing lab: your kitchen. Dan Jones shares recipes for classic tipples
such as the Margarita and Martini to the more modern Thank God it's Friday and Morning After, in a format
close to all men's hearts - the manual.

Starting with 'Basic Tools', Dan covers the fundamental kit required to make your moonshine - the shaker,
glassware, bottle opener, spirits and mixers, along with manly patience and know-how. He then moves on to
signature drinks, social occasions and designer ice - no element of the cocktail goes unturned.

Mixers Manual is witty, informative, and packed with more cocktails than you should probably ever make.
With a stylish design inspired by vintage instruction manuals and stunning illustrations throughout, Mixers
Manual is set to become a classic.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Oneal:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find guide that need more time to be study.
The Mixers Manual: The Cocktail Bible for Serious Drinkers can be your answer since it can be read by you
who have those short extra time problems.

Kathy Donnelly:

The book untitled The Mixers Manual: The Cocktail Bible for Serious Drinkers contain a lot of information
on it. The writer explains your ex idea with easy technique. The language is very clear to see all the people,
so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was published by famous author. The
author gives you in the new period of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can read
more your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy
the e-book, you can available their official web-site and order it. Have a nice study.

Daryl Pena:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book The Mixers Manual: The Cocktail Bible for Serious
Drinkers was colourful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book The Mixers
Manual: The Cocktail Bible for Serious Drinkers has many kinds or style. Start from kids until teenagers. For
example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on there.
Therefore , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to
choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading that.

Kenneth Jordan:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the particular book The Mixers Manual: The
Cocktail Bible for Serious Drinkers to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of
reading skill is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy
to see it and mingle the opinion about book and reading through especially. It is to be initial opinion for you
to like to start a book and go through it. Beside that the reserve The Mixers Manual: The Cocktail Bible for
Serious Drinkers can to be your friend when you're sense alone and confuse in what must you're doing of
these time.
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