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In these thoughtful, yet playful poems, Belford builds a poetry experience the curious reader can open
anywhere, read, and read on. Although the phrasing of his lines is unusual, Ken Belford’s poetry is not easily
forgotten. It’s not necessary to begin at the beginning or to read to the end to get a good sense of what this
poet is about. Read a little, or read a lot; he’s worth it.

Ken Belford is a timber framer. He has managed a northern wood lot, from which he has milled his own
lumber, carrying out most of the timbers for his buildings on his back. These thoughtful, yet playful poems,
like his structures, tell of powerful connections artfully made, of an earned sense of how things work, and an
intimate awareness of the cycle of all things.
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From reader reviews:

Gracie Davis:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive at this point,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
by simply surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a reserve your ability to survive increase then having chance to remain than
other is high. For you who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of Slick Reckoning book as
basic and daily reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Steven Tran:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Slick Reckoning as the daily resource
information.

Marlon Hood:

The reserve with title Slick Reckoning contains a lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a
lot of benefit after read this book. This particular book exist new know-how the information that exist in this
book represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement
of the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-
book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Marilyn Chambers:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you might have it
in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This Slick Reckoning can give you a lot of good friends because
by you considering this one book you have factor that they don't and make you actually more like an
interesting person. This kind of book can be one of one step for you to get success. This book offer you
information that possibly your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than various other make you to be
great people. So , why hesitate? We should have Slick Reckoning.
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