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This text combines a positive and practical approach to the study of marriage and family life. It is based on
extensive and up-to-date research as reported in the journals and monographs. It shows how sociological
theories apply to the various topics. Thus, it not only provides students with a basic understanding of
marriage and family life, but also helps them apply this knowledge to enrich their lives and nurture their own
intimate relationships.

McGraw-Hill Connect® is a subscription-based learning service accessible online through your personal
computer or tablet. Choose this option if your instructor will require Connect to be used in the course. Your
subscription to Connect includes the following:

• SmartBook® - an adaptive digital version of the course textbook that personalizes your reading experience
based on how well you are learning the content.
• Access to your instructor’s homework assignments, quizzes, syllabus, notes, reminders, and other important
files for the course.
• Progress dashboards that quickly show how you are performing on your assignments and tips for
improvement.
• The option to purchase (for a small fee) a print version of the book. This binder-ready, loose-leaf version
includes free shipping.

Complete system requirements to use Connect can be found here:
http://www.mheducation.com/highered/platforms/connect/training-support-students.html
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Carlson:

Book will be written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a book.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world. Next to that
you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Loose Leaf for Marriages and Families with Connect
Access Card will make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about
every little thing. But some of you think this open or reading the book make you bored. It isn't make you fun.
Why they may be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or suited book with you?

Federico Hayward:

The book Loose Leaf for Marriages and Families with Connect Access Card can give more knowledge and
also the precise product information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the best thing like
a book Loose Leaf for Marriages and Families with Connect Access Card? Several of you have a different
opinion about book. But one aim in which book can give many information for us. It is absolutely
appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, it is
possible to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Loose Leaf for Marriages and Families with
Connect Access Card has simple shape however you know: it has great and big function for you. You can
appear the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Francisco Garcia:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on
what kind of reserve you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want
experience happy read one along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The particular
Loose Leaf for Marriages and Families with Connect Access Card is kind of guide which is giving the reader
unstable experience.

William Kozak:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you
know that little person such as reading or as examining become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important and book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except your
own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update with regards to something by book. Amount types of
books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is actually Loose Leaf for Marriages and Families
with Connect Access Card.
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