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Do you need somewhere to write your thoughts? Or are you looking for that perfect gift for your
special someone?

This is a blank, lined journal with a naughty, swear word on the cover. You won’t be able to find a journal
like this in the stores! It’s also 6x9, the perfect size to take anywhere!

Remember, there are many benefits to journaling and writing down your thoughts. Among these are stress
reduction, numerous healing benefits, personal growth and so much more. Plus with the swear word on the
cover, it will surely lead to many laughs and smiles.

It's a perfect gift for many occasions - birthdays, holidays, a gag gift, Father’s Day or any day you want to
treat yourself or a loved one. All at a very affordable price.

If you are looking for unlined pages, make sure to check out our other journals.
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From reader reviews:

Cameron Trammell:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book that
will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of publication
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want truly feel happy
read one together with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the Dickhead Journal: Blank Lined -
6x9 - Gag Gift is kind of guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Albert Jones:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Dickhead Journal: Blank Lined - 6x9 - Gag Gift, you
may enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hangout type
is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout people. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its known as reading
friends.

Sally Rose:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading through
a book. Ugh, ya think reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
fine you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Dickhead Journal:
Blank Lined - 6x9 - Gag Gift which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.

Darlene Kidd:

E-book is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the up-date information of year to be able to year. As we
know those textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around
the world. From the book Dickhead Journal: Blank Lined - 6x9 - Gag Gift we can get more advantage. Don't
you to be creative people? To get creative person must love to read a book. Just choose the best book that
acceptable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this book Dickhead Journal: Blank Lined -
6x9 - Gag Gift. You can more desirable than now.
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