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Lizzy loves the big apple tree in her yard more than anything. So when the first day of school comes, she
picks a beautiful apple, turns it into a makeshift doll she names Susanna, and takes it along to keep her
company. But her teacher tells her that dolls aren't allowed at school. Even worse, her sister says that
Susanna won't last forever. Then Lizzy's mom shows her a way to turn Susanna into a real apple doll. And
with the help of Susanna the Apple Doll, Lizzy overcomes her shyness at school and makes plenty of new
friends to bring home to play in her beloved apple tree.

Detailed, delightful collage illustrations accompany this sweet story about one girl's success in bringing
together her home world and her school world. Instructions for making an apple doll just like Susanna are
included!
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Llamas:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even restricted. What people must be consider if
those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking seriously which
one works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then you
buy it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen within you if you take The Apple Doll as the daily resource information.

Pablo Torrey:

Typically the book The Apple Doll has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of
benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Tom makes some research before write this
book. This book very easy to read you may get the point easily after reading this article book.

Jessica Henriquez:

Beside this The Apple Doll in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get more close to the new
knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh in the oven so
don't possibly be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have
The Apple Doll because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you often have
book but you do not get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in your
hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you
still want to miss that? Find this book along with read it from at this point!

Vickie Flores:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news. With this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social similar
to newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking the The
Apple Doll when you desired it?
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