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In pain, challenged by an illness that makes her feel helpless, author Donna Lee Gauntlett finds joy.

Finding Pockets of Happiness: An Illustrated Memoir reveals how it is possible to find moments of joy and
happiness that, even in the darkest days, bring a smile to your face.

For Gauntlett, that joy is tapping into her art skills while overcoming sickness and injury. Time she spends
recovering becomes time she spends discovering her skills—and uncovering the bravery needed to step
outside of her comfort zone to sell her art and speak in public.

It isn’t the end of her struggles, though, as she loses her pets and goes through other major life changes. But
Gauntlett embraces her inner child, turns her passion into purpose, and learns to be grateful for the small
things in life.

Whether readers are going through midlife crises, attempting to find happiness and inspiration, or
overcoming illness and looking for hope, they will find their own joy in this beautifully illustrated memoir.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Woodyard:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the publication entitled Finding Pockets of Happiness. Try to face the book Finding
Pockets of Happiness as your pal. It means that it can for being your friend when you truly feel alone and
beside those of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book
makes you far more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , we should make new
experience and also knowledge with this book.

William Tietjen:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on
guys this specific aren't like that. This Finding Pockets of Happiness book is readable simply by you who
hate those straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience
without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer of Finding Pockets of
Happiness content conveys the thought easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are not
different in the articles but it just different in the form of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Finding Pockets
of Happiness is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Donald Wexler:

This Finding Pockets of Happiness usually are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The
explanation of this Finding Pockets of Happiness can be one of several great books you must have is giving
you more than just simple examining food but feed a person with information that might be will shock your
prior knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions
throughout the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Finding Pockets of Happiness giving you an
enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that could it useful in
your day action. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

David Mathews:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind expertise or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find publication
that need more time to be read. Finding Pockets of Happiness can be your answer since it can be read by you
who have those short extra time problems.
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