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In follow-up studies, dozens of reviews, and even a book of essays evaluating his conclusions, Gerald
Rosenberg’s critics—not to mention his supporters—have spent nearly two decades debating the arguments
he first put forward in The Hollow Hope. With this substantially expanded second edition of his landmark
work, Rosenberg himself steps back into the fray, responding to criticism and adding chapters on the same-
sex marriage battle that ask anew whether courts can spur political and social reform.
            Finding that the answer is still a resounding no, Rosenberg reaffirms his powerful contention that it’s
nearly impossible to generate significant reforms through litigation. The reason? American courts are
ineffective and relatively weak—far from the uniquely powerful sources for change they’re often portrayed
as. Rosenberg supports this claim by documenting the direct and secondary effects of key court
decisions—particularly Brown v. Board of Education and Roe v. Wade. He reveals, for example, that
Congress, the White House, and a determined civil rights movement did far more than Brown to advance
desegregation, while pro-choice activists invested too much in Roe at the expense of political mobilization.
Further illuminating these cases, as well as the ongoing fight for same-sex marriage rights, Rosenberg also
marshals impressive evidence to overturn the common assumption that even unsuccessful litigation can
advance a cause by raising its profile.
            Directly addressing its critics in a new conclusion, The Hollow Hope, Second Edition promises to
reignite for a new generation the national debate it sparked seventeen years ago.
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From reader reviews:

Greg Little:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Books can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire all their reader with their story or their
experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write about the data about something
that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children, there are many kinds
of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their talent in writing, they also doing
some study before they write to their book. One of them is this The Hollow Hope: Can Courts Bring About
Social Change? Second Edition (American Politics and Political Economy Series).

Tom Baptist:

This The Hollow Hope: Can Courts Bring About Social Change? Second Edition (American Politics and
Political Economy Series) is great reserve for you because the content and that is full of information for you
who also always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it
information accurately using great manage word or we can declare no rambling sentences within it. So if you
are read it hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward
sentences but hard core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having The Hollow Hope: Can
Courts Bring About Social Change? Second Edition (American Politics and Political Economy Series) in
your hand like getting the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no
e-book that offer you world inside ten or fifteen tiny right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be
good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt in which?

Amy Arwood:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library as well as to
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart or real their
pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't see colorful pics
on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on this period of
time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this The Hollow Hope: Can Courts Bring About Social Change? Second Edition (American
Politics and Political Economy Series) can make you experience more interested to read.

Douglas Brownlee:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen need book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. Through the



book The Hollow Hope: Can Courts Bring About Social Change? Second Edition (American Politics and
Political Economy Series) we can have more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To be
creative person must choose to read a book. Merely choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't
possibly be doubt to change your life at this book The Hollow Hope: Can Courts Bring About Social
Change? Second Edition (American Politics and Political Economy Series). You can more appealing than
now.
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