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Return to Dar al-Basha by the contemporary Tunisian author Hassan Nasr depicts the childhood of Murtada
al-Shamikh and his return forty years later to his home in the medina or old city of Tunis. After being taken
from his mother and raised in his father's home where he was physically abused and emotionally
marginalized, Murtada spends a life of anxiety wandering the world. His return is prompted by a mysterious
visit from one of his father's Sufi friends as he roams the desert in Mauritania. Murtada retraces his steps
through the medina to his family's house in anticipation of a possible reunion with his troubled father, vividly
reliving sights, smells, and sounds from his childhood and evoking his childhood initiation into Islamic
mysticism as he experiences a personal journey of the spirit across space and time.

Nasr succeeds in conjuring up a Tunisian boyhood not unlike his own and brings to life in a poetic, sensual
narrative the spaces, light, colors, and life of Tunis some six decades ago. Murtada searches the streets of
Tunis and his memories for the decisive mistake he feels he must have made-that has left him a perpetual
wanderer until he undergoes a cathartic nightmare sequence that leaves him shaken. Only then is he finally
able to come to peace with his past and with himself. In William M. Hutchins' lucid translation, the novel
serves as an evocation and tribute to the historic city of Tunis the novel and meditates about the position of
the past in a rapidly modernizing society.
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From reader reviews:

Lillian Chatman:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, limited story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying Return to Dar al-Basha: A Novel
(Middle East Literature In Translation) that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by means of
reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world a
great deal better then how they react to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading habit only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who
want to start reading through as your good habit, you could pick Return to Dar al-Basha: A Novel (Middle
East Literature In Translation) become your current starter.

Vera Harris:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Return to Dar al-Basha: A
Novel (Middle East Literature In Translation) which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's view.

Edda Allen:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Return to Dar al-Basha: A Novel (Middle
East Literature In Translation) can be the answer, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are and so
out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So
what these ebooks have than the others?

Kristy Moore:

Some people said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book Return to Dar al-Basha: A Novel (Middle East
Literature In Translation) to make your current reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading
ability is developing when you including reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you
just read it and mingle the opinion about book and studying especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like
to open up a book and go through it. Beside that the guide Return to Dar al-Basha: A Novel (Middle East
Literature In Translation) can to be your new friend when you're experience alone and confuse using what
must you're doing of these time.
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