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This is Volume One of a three-volume set, comprising much of Crowley's early material, written mostly
between 1898-1902. His earliest works, written between 1887-1897, were almost entirely destroyed by
authorities due to their offensive nature. In writing the material that appears in this volume, Crowley toned
things down a notch and moved away from the more lurid and graphic sexual themes he had been primarily
focused on. He concentrates almost entirely on religion and mythology in this collection. This reflects a time
in his life when he was awakening to an important mystical and spiritual level. It can be seen by the reader
how Crowley continues to grow and mature into more advanced ideas in the two remaining volumes, as well.
It is hard to think of Crowley as a poet, but his style and advanced mystical vocabulary are unique and go
beyond that of everyday poets. His plays are also interesting. Crowley once said that the last play,
"Tanhauser: The Story of All Time," contained the theory of special relativity, which Einstein clarified more
fully and scientifically three years later, in 1905. This volume contains four poems, five plays, four sections
of shorter poems, an Epilogue, and an interesting Appendix on Qabalistic Dogma.
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From reader reviews:

Tammy Crider:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys
this aren't like that. This The Works of Aleister Crowley Vol. 1 book is readable through you who hate those
perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without
leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer involving The Works of
Aleister Crowley Vol. 1 content conveys objective easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and
e-book are not different in the content but it just different such as it. So , do you continue to thinking The
Works of Aleister Crowley Vol. 1 is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Debbie Jones:

Reading a book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their own reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the data
about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there are
many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their proficiency in
writing, they also doing some exploration before they write for their book. One of them is this The Works of
Aleister Crowley Vol. 1.

Adrian Johnson:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or maybe playing
video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read some
sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent 24 hours a day
to reading a guide. The book The Works of Aleister Crowley Vol. 1 it is quite good to read. There are a lot of
those who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space
bringing this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book out of your smart
phone. The price is not to fund but this book has high quality.

David Burch:

Beside that The Works of Aleister Crowley Vol. 1 in your phone, it could give you a way to get nearer to the
new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from the oven
so don't always be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have The
Works of Aleister Crowley Vol. 1 because this book offers for you readable information. Do you oftentimes
have book but you rarely get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this
inside your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island.
Techniques you still want to miss the idea? Find this book and also read it from right now!
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