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Author of more than thirteen books and several volumes of poetry, screenwriter, and director, Edith Bruck is
one of the leading literary voices in Italy, attracting increasing attention in the English-speaking world not
least for her powerful Holocaust testimony, which is often compared with the work of her contemporaries
Primo Levi and Giorgio Bassani. Born in Hungary in 1932, she was deported with her family to the
concentration camps of Auschwitz, Dachau, Christianstadt, Landsberg, and Bergen-Belsen, where she lost
both her parents and a brother. After the war, she traveled widely until 1954 when she settled in Rome. She
has lived there ever since. This important new study is motivated by a desire to better understand and situate
Bruck’s art as well as to advance (and, when necessary, to revise) the critical discourse on her considerable
and eclectic body of work. As such, it underscores and analyzes the intermedial nature of her contributions to
contemporary Italian culture, which should no longer be understood merely in terms of her willingness to
revisit the subject of the Holocaust on the printed page or the silver screen. It also includes previously
unpublished interviews with the author. The book will be of broad interest to scholars and students of Jewish
(especially Holocaust) studies, Italian literature, film studies, women’s studies, and postcolonial
culture.“This is the first comprehensive scholarly analysis of the work produced by a main contemporary
author of Italian Holocaust literature, focused on Bruck’s overall artistic production (novels, poetry, film,
and TV productions). It will offer scholars and students alike a new interpretive perspective and a valuable
source of reference for their studies.” Gabriella Romani, Seton Hall University.
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From reader reviews:

Nathan Hutchison:

This Edith Bruck in the Mirror: Fictional Transitions and Cinematic Narratives (Shofar Supplements in
Jewish Studies) book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The
benefit you obtain by reading this book is information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get data
which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This Edith Bruck in the Mirror:
Fictional Transitions and Cinematic Narratives (Shofar Supplements in Jewish Studies) without we realize
teach the one who reading through it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry
Edith Bruck in the Mirror: Fictional Transitions and Cinematic Narratives (Shofar Supplements in Jewish
Studies) can bring when you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you
can have it inside your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Edith Bruck in the Mirror: Fictional
Transitions and Cinematic Narratives (Shofar Supplements in Jewish Studies) having very good arrangement
in word as well as layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Bridgett Killion:

This book untitled Edith Bruck in the Mirror: Fictional Transitions and Cinematic Narratives (Shofar
Supplements in Jewish Studies) to be one of several books this best seller in this year, here is because when
you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the
book retailer or you can order it by using online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you
more easily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason to
you to past this e-book from your list.

Doris Blair:

The book Edith Bruck in the Mirror: Fictional Transitions and Cinematic Narratives (Shofar Supplements in
Jewish Studies) has a lot associated with on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of gain.
The book was written by the very famous author. The author makes some research before write this book.
This book very easy to read you can find the point easily after reading this book.

Gloria Lafreniere:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you
read a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge,
due to the fact book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your review, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Edith Bruck in the Mirror: Fictional Transitions and Cinematic Narratives (Shofar
Supplements in Jewish Studies) provide you with new experience in reading through a book.
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