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Slammin' Simon teaches aspiring rockstars all the rudiments, grooves and fills they need to get drumming in
no time!

His fun instructional resources are perfect for use in the lesson room, by instructors who work with young
students, as well as at home, by parents of children learning to play percussion.

In his Guide to Mastering Your First Rock & Roll Drum Beats, Simon and his pet turtle, Rudi, introduce the
basic quarter-note and eighth-note drumset beats needed to start performing in the Rock music style.

PRO TIP: Thanks to Amazon's awesome MatchBook program, buying the PRINT version of this book
allows you access to the Kindle digital copy for . . . wait for it . . . FREE!
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From reader reviews:

Myron Abbott:

Typically the book Slammin' Simon's Guide to Mastering Your First Rock & Roll Drum Beats! will bring
you to the new experience of reading any book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In the
event you try to find new book you just read, this book very appropriate to you. The book Slammin' Simon's
Guide to Mastering Your First Rock & Roll Drum Beats! is much recommended to you to learn. You can
also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Sandra Davis:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, short story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not trying Slammin' Simon's Guide
to Mastering Your First Rock & Roll Drum Beats! that give your fun preference will be satisfied by means of
reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world far
better then how they react toward the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading addiction only for the
geeky person but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for every you who want to start
reading as your good habit, you could pick Slammin' Simon's Guide to Mastering Your First Rock & Roll
Drum Beats! become your personal starter.

Santos Ball:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-book
means, more simple and reachable. This kind of Slammin' Simon's Guide to Mastering Your First Rock &
Roll Drum Beats! can give you a lot of friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have factor
that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step
for you to get success. This publication offer you information that probably your friend doesn't recognize, by
knowing more than different make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let me have Slammin' Simon's
Guide to Mastering Your First Rock & Roll Drum Beats!.

Joanna Bowen:

As a scholar exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library as well
as to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's spirit or
real their passion. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there
but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't
see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this Slammin' Simon's Guide to Mastering Your First Rock & Roll Drum
Beats! can make you really feel more interested to read.
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