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Following on his successful Guides to the plots and themes of Shakespeare's plays, Robert Fallon now
explores the world of characters created by the Bard. Like Mr. Fallon's earlier books, A Theatergoer's Guide
to Shakespeare's Characters is designed to enhance the playgoer's enjoyment of a performance, but it also
makes for enlightening reading after the show. Intended for the general reader, it is written in plain but not
inelegant English and avoids the specialized language of the theater and the academy. More than eight
hundred characters appear in Shakespeare's thirty-eight plays?an astonishing variety of kings and queens,
mothers and fathers, clowns and fairies, peasants and dukes, villains and heroes, the young and the old, the
sinning and the sinned against. How could he have known so many in his diverse culture and portrayed them
so convincingly? Mr. Fallon has chosen some sixty of these figures to examine. With few exceptions, they
are the ones that modern theatergoers are most likely to encounter in performance, those that have captured
the imagination of audiences over the centuries: Lear, Hamlet, Cleopatra, Rosalind, Portia, and the like. But
some lesser-known characters are offered for their inherent interest and their example of Shakespeare's
"infinite variety." Mr. Fallon locates each of them in the story of their play, relates them to other characters,
shows how they change (or don't), and sums up their character and nature. Readers of his other Guides know
they will find in Characters an entertaining and useful appraisal.

"This book is as handy as they come...distilled without being dunderheaded?reader-friendly in the
extreme."?American Theatre (on A Theatergoer's Guide to Shakespeare)
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From reader reviews:

Charlotte Maas:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important usually. The book A Theatergoer's Guide to Shakespeare's Characters has
been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It doesn't
matter what advantages for you. The e-book A Theatergoer's Guide to Shakespeare's Characters is not only
giving you a lot more new information but also for being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend
your personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship together with the book A Theatergoer's
Guide to Shakespeare's Characters. You never truly feel lose out for everything in the event you read some
books.

Michael Pauls:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new data. When
you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of numerous ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you looking at a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the
story how the characters do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to some others. When
you read this A Theatergoer's Guide to Shakespeare's Characters, you could tells your family, friends and
soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a guide.

Kevin Shepherd:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or all
their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic in the park.
They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill your
current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The first
thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to try look for book,
may be the publication untitled A Theatergoer's Guide to Shakespeare's Characters can be great book to read.
May be it is usually best activity to you.

Ophelia Ellis:

This A Theatergoer's Guide to Shakespeare's Characters is new way for you who has curiosity to look for
some information as it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you
know or you who still having little bit of digest in reading this A Theatergoer's Guide to Shakespeare's
Characters can be the light food in your case because the information inside that book is easy to get simply
by anyone. These books build itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-
book contact form. People who think that in publication form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is



the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find actually looking
for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and
knowledge.
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